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Request Ref: 2710 
 
FOI Request dated 08/09/2022 as follows –  
 

1. Across the courses offered at your institution, how many contact hours* are being 
provided remotely (i.e. exclusively online) in the 2022/23 academic year? 

2. Across the courses offered at your institution, how many contact hours* are being 
provided in person in the 2022/23 academic year? 

3. Across the courses offered at your institution, how many contact hours* were provided 
remotely (i.e. exclusively online) in the 2018/19 academic year? 

4. Across the courses offered at your institution, how many contact hours* were provided in 
person in the 2018/19 academic year? 

5. Which of your courses on offer for 2022/23 has the most online contact hours*? 
6. How many online contact hours* does that course offer across the year?  
7. What is the total number of contact hours* for the course for the year? 
8. Please answer the same questions as numbers 5-7, but for the year 2018-19 

 
*Definition: Contact hours means any lectures, seminars, tutorials or other types of contact time. Online 
contact hours means any of that time which is now being held exclusively online - such as by video call - 
instead of in person. 
 
Response 
 

1. Information not held (The 2022/23 timetable is not complete and therefore this information cannot 
be provided.) 

2. Information not held (The 2022/23 timetable is not complete and therefore this information cannot 
be provided.) 

3. 1737 Hours of teaching 
4. 101819 Hours of teaching 
5. Information not held. 
6. Same as Q5 
7. Same as Q5 
8. Information not held  

 
 


