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Request Ref: 2705
FOI Request dated 02/09/2022 as follows —

Under the FOIA (2000), | would like to request the following information for the most recent academic
year, 2020/2021:

Q1. How many students in total were enrolled on HE courses at your institution during the academic year
2020/21? (HE courses include Access to HE, Undergraduate degrees, Postgraduate degrees and Higher/
Degree apprenticeships).

Q2. Did you collect data on the parental status of students at your institution during the academic year
2020/20217 (If the answer is no, please state a reason for this.)

Q3. How many young fathers did you have studying HE courses at your institution during the academic
year 2020/20217
(A young father is defined as male, aged 25 or under with at least one child. Please include Access to HE,
Undergraduate degrees, Postgraduate degrees and Higher/Degree apprenticeships).
Q4. Where possible, please break down the total number of young student-fathers identified in question 3
into the following categories for the academic year 2020/21.:

a) Number of young fathers studying Undergraduate degrees:

b) Number of young fathers studying Postgraduate degrees:

¢) Number of young fathers studying Higher/ degree apprenticeships:

d) Number of young fathers studying Access to HE courses:

Response
.Q1- L
evel of Study Student Count 2020
First degree 10735
Other undergraduate 1105
Postgraduate (research) 590
Postgraduate (taught) 2186

Q2 - Information not held. We do not capture parental status on application as it does not make a
material difference as to whether an applicant will be offered a place nor the conditions of the offer, and
therefore is deemed not relevant as per the data protection act.

Q3 - Information not held.

Q4 — Information not held.




